l San Miguel Community Services District I

Organization & Personnel Committee

Regular Meeting
THURSDAY, June9, 2016 5:00 P.M.

SMCSD Boardroom 1150 Mission St. San Miguel, CA 93451

Cell Phones: As a courtesy to others, please silence yourptelhe or pager during the meeting
and engage in conversations outside the Boardroom.

Americans with Disabilities Act: If you need special assistance to participate is riieeting,
please contact the CSD Clerk at (805) 467-3388ifisation 48 hours in advance will enable the
CSD to make reasonable arrangements to ensuresdmtigsto this meeting. Assisted listening
devices are available for the hearing impaired.

Public Comment: When public attendance is over ten (10) persons, the following policies
will go into effect: Any person wishing to address the Board or Stan@logimittee, please
complete a “Request to Speak” form located at iy in the boardroom in order to address
the Board of Directors on any agenda item. Commargdimited to three minutes, unless you
have registered with CSD Clerk prior to the meeting

If you wish to speak on an item not on the agenda, you may do so under “Oral
Communications.” Any member of the public may addréhe Board of Directors on items on
the Consent Calendar. Please complete a “Requé&qtdak” form as noted above and indicate
which item number you wish to address.

Meeting Schedule: Regular Board of Director meetings are generalydhon the fourth
Thursday of each month at 7:00 P.M in the CSD hoard. The Agenda’s are posted on the
CSD’s website atwww.sanmiguelcsd.org

Agendas: Agenda packets are available for the public ingpect2 hours prior to the scheduled
meeting at the Counter/ San Miguel CSD, Fire Staliicated at 1150 Mission St., San Miguel,
during normal business hours. Any agenda-relatéthgs or documents provided to a majority
of the Board of Directors after distribution of tlegjenda packet are available for public
inspection at the same time at the counter/ SanuéligSD, Fire Station located at 1150 Mission
St., San Miguel, during normal business hours.

Page 1 of2
6-9-2016 O & P Committee Agenda



V.

Call to Order- 5:00 P.M Chair Green
Pledge of Allegiance
Roll Call: Directors: Green Kalvans

Oral and Written Communications: Persons wishing to speak on a matter not
on the agenda may be heard at this time; howeweaction will be taken until
placed on a future agenda. Speakers are limitdtée minutes. Please complete
a “Request to Speak” form and place in basket plex\i

AGENDA:

1 Review and Discuss Draft Amendment to Ordinance No. 01-2013
adopting amendments to the California Fire Code 2013 edition related to no
parkingrestrictionsin alleyways.

Staff Recommendation: Discuss and Consider making recommendations to the
Board for amending Fire Code 2013 edition.

M S

2. Review and Discuss Section 2020 of Existing Personnel Policies for
Recruitment and Hiring of new employees.

Staff Recommendation: Discuss and Give Direction to Staff.

M S

VIil. COMMITTEE COMMENTS

This section is intended as an opportunity for Committee members to make brief announcements,
request information from staff, request future agenda item(s) and/or report on their own activities
related to District business. No action is to be taken until an item is placed on a future agenda.

Vi, ADJOURNMENT Time:

ATTEST:

STATE OF CALIFORNIA )
COUNTY OF SAN LUISOBISPO ) ss.
COMMUNITY OF SAN MIGUEL )

I, Tamara Parent, Account Clerk of San Miguel Community Services District, hereby certify that | caused the
posting of this agenda at the SM CSD district office on June 3, 2016

Date: June 3, 2016

T amara Parent

Tamara Parent, Account Clerk Il / Operations Coor dinator

Page 2 of 2
6-9-2016 O & P Committee Agenda



San Miguel Community Services District
Organization & Personnel Committee

June9, 2016 AGENDA ITEM: V.1

SUBJECT: Review and Discuss Amending Existing District Fire Code regulations
pertaining to 2013 CFC, District Ordinance No. 01-2013, Section 503.4 as
adopted.

STAFF RECOMMENDATION:

Review and Discuss amending Existing District Fire Code regulations pertaining to 2013CFC,
District Ordinance No. 01-2013, Section 503.4 and make recommendation to the Board of
Directors.

BACKGROUND:

This request was first reviewed by O&P Committee at its March meeting. At which time,
Committee asked Staff to research options for fire lane no parking restrictions, specifically
citation authority in aleys, designated fire lane locations.

Current District fire code, Ordinance No 01-2013, Section 503.4 states that "the Fire Chief
and/or his or her authorized representatives shall have the power and authority to remove or
cause to remove, without notice, any vehicle or object parked or placed in violation of the
California Fire Code. The owner of the vehicle or other object removed is responsible for all
costs for towing, storage and other charges incurred.”

The California Fire Code, edition 2013, as adopted by the Board is the authority to regulate use
of alleyways and designated fire lane locations within the District. Chief Roberson has a map of
such designations and locations in San Miguel, which includes but not limited to: all alleyways
generally located west of Mission Street and in the White Oaks Mobile Home Park. These are
just two examples.

The aleyways are posted as No Parking locations and areas. However, there are some alleyway
locations where no parking signage consistently gets removed causing extra time and expense to
replace a sign. Posting signage along the alleyway entries also does not nor can such signs
prevent or regulate off of the alleyways parking of personal vehicles. Certain no parking signs
have been removed by unauthorized persons on occasion. Fire officials do not have a citation
authority under the CFC or District Ordinance. However periodic or routine inspections can be
conducted by fire officias.



There have been past complaints about personal vehicles parking in amanner causing a situation
where potential obstruction of fire apparatus access may occur. On those occasions, the Fire
Chief or Assistant Fire Chief have investigated and initiated action to remove such vehicle
obstructions with the authority granted by Section 503.4.

ALTERNATIVES:

In order for the CHP officers, who have vehicle enforcement authority, to cite and issue a code
violation ticket to vehicle owners, there needs to be a specific code section included on the
posted No Parking signs. There are 32 total signs posted on the identified aleyways and a
smaller number of designated fire lanes.

Community notice should be sent out spelling out any coming signage and enforcement change.
Such a notice could be coordinated with monthly billing notices as a separate flyer and provided
in 2 languages.

Code modifications to Ordinance 01-2013 would also have to conducted as a public hearing at a
regular meeting. A propsoed modification to Section 3, subsection O, section 503.4 -
OBSTRUCTION OF FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS should consider including the
following added language to Section:

"All posted No Parking signs located in alleyways and other designated fire lanes shall provide
this code section for purposes of vehicular or object parked or placed in violation to be cited by a
law enforcement officer and/or caused to be towed as authorized by Section 503.4 herein.”

Staff Recommendation:
Staff recommends that the Committee discuss and give direction to Staff prior to making a
recommendation to the Board for action.

PREPARED BY:

Darvell Gentry
Genera Manager

Attachment: Ordinance 01-2013



ORDINANCE No. 01-2013

AN ORDINANCE OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS
OF THE SAN MIGUEL COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRICT
ADOPTING WITH AMENDMENTS THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE 2013 EDITION,
THE 2012 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL WILDLAND URBAN INTERFACE
CODE AND THE 2013 NATIONAL FIRE PROTECTION ASSOCIATION STANDARD
1144

WHEREAS, the San Miguel Community Services District (“District”) is a special
district formed pursuant to California Government Code Sections 61000 et seq.; and

WHEREAS, California Government Code Section 61100(d) provides that a
Community Services District has the express power to supply the inhabitants of the
District with fire protection in the same manner as a fire protection district formed
pursuant to the Fire Protection District Law (Health and Safety Code Sections 13800 et
seq); and

WHEREAS, Section 13869 of the Health and Safety Code of the State of California
provides that a District may adopt a fire prevention code by reference pursuant to Article
2 (commencing with section 50022) of Chapter 1 of Part 1 of Division 1 of Title 5 of the
Government Code; and

WHEREAS, the Board previously approved Resolution No. 2010-09 setting forth the
necessary local, climatic, geographical and topographical conditions findings to amend
sections of the 2007 California Fire Code pursuant to California Health and Safety Code
Sections 13869.7, 18941.5 and 17958.7

; and

WHEREAS, on December 16™ 2010, Ordinance No. 02-10 was adopted adopting
and amending the 2010 California Fire Code, 2009 Edition of the International Wildland
Urban Interface Code and the 2010 National Fire Protection Association Standard 1144;
and

WHEREAS, in order for the District to provide better and more comprehensive fire
protection service to its inhabitants, the District desires to adopt, with amendments, the
most current editions of the: California Fire Code — 2013 edition, the International
Wildland Urban Interface Code — 2012 edition, and the 2013 National Fire Protection
Association Standard 1144.

Page 1



NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the Board of Directors of the San
Miguel Community Services District as follows:

SECTION 1: ADOPTION OF CODES.

A. 2013 California Fire Code. Except as amended herein, the 2013 California Fire
Code, as amended, including all Articles and Appendices, is hereby adopted by
the San Miguel Community Services District and incorporated herein by this
reference as though set forth in full.

B. 2012 International Wildland Urban Interface Code. Except as amended herein,
the 2009 International Wildland Urban Interface Code, as amended, including all
Articles and Appendices, is hereby adopted by the San Miguel Community
Services District and incorporated herein by this reference as though set forth in
full.

C. 2013 National Fire Protection Association Standard 1144. Except as amended
herein, the 2008 Nationa! Fire Protection Association Standard 1144, as
amended, including all Articles and Appendices, is hereby adopted by the San
Miguel Community Services District and incorporated herein by this reference as
though set forth in full.

SECTION 2: ESTABLISHMENT AND DUTIES OF THE BUREAU OF FIRE
PREVENTION.

The California Fire Code, International Wildland Urban interface Code and
International Wildland Urban Interface Code shall be regulated and enforced by the San
Miguel Community Services District Fire Department, operated under the supervision of
the Chief of the Fire Department. The Bureau of Fire Prevention is hereby established
and shall be operated under the supervision of the Fire Chief. The Fire Chief may
designate such members of the department as inspectors from time-to-time as
necessary.

SECTION 3: AMENDMENTS AND EXCEPTIONS TO THE 2013 CALIFORNIA FIRE
CODE AND THE 2012 INTERNATIONAL WILDLAND URBAN
INTERFACE CODE

Pursuant to Resolution 2013-20, the Board of Directors of the San Miguel
Community Services District found that due to certain local climatic, geological and
topographical conditions exist within the District, more stringent building standards
relating to fire and public safety than those standards adopted by the State Fire
Marshal, and contained in the 2013 California Fire Code and2012 International Wildland
Urban Interface Code are necessary for adequate and sufficient fire protection within
the District. Resolution No. 2013-20 and the findings contained therein are hereby
incorporated herein by this reference. Therefore, the following amendments and
exceptions to the 2013 California Fire Code and 2012 International Wildland Urban
Interface Code are adopted:

A. 2013 CFC SECTION 101.1 — TITLE: is hereby amended to read:

Page 2



“These reguiations shall be known as the Fire Code of the San Miguel
Community Services District Fire Department, (SMFD) hereinafter referred to as
"the fire code.” The SMFD shall also be the enforcing public entity.

B. 2013 CFC SECTION 103.2 -- APPOINTMENT: is hereby amended to read.

“Appointment. The fire code official shall be appointed by the San Miguel
Community Services District Board of Directors.”

C. 2013 CFC SECTION 104.1 — GENERAL.: is hereby amended to add the following
provision:

“The Fire Chief and his or her designees shall have the authority of Peace
Officers or Public Officers pursuant to the California Penal Code sections
830.37(a) and 830.37(b) in the performance of their duties under the California
Fire Code and all other adopted Fire and Life Safety codes.”

D. 2013 CFC SECTION 108.1 — BOARD OF APPEALS ESTABLISHED: is hereby
amended in its entirety to read as follows:

“To determine the suitability of alternate materials and types of construction and
to provide for reasonable interpretations of the provisions of this code, there
shall be and hereby is created a Board of Appeals consisting of the five
members of the San Miguel Community Services District Board of Directors.
When a San Migue! Community Services District Fire Code Appeal Board is
convened, the Board of Directors shall become members of the San Miguel
Community Services District Fire Code Appeal Board. The existing rules and
regulations of the San Miguel Community Services District Board of Directors
shall apply for appeal proceedings under this code. All decisions and findings
will be placed into writing and a copy sent to the Fire Chief and the appellant.”

E. 2013 CFC SECTION 202 — GENERAL DEFINITIONS: The definition of “FIRE
CODE OFFICIAL” is hereby amended to read as follows:

“The San Miguel Community Services District Fire Department fire chief is the
designated authority charged with the administration and enforcement of the
code, or a duly authorized representative.”

F. 2013 CFC SECTION 202 — GENERAL DEFINITIONS: is hereby amended to
add the following definition:

SKY LANTERN — An airborne lantern typically made of paper with a wood frame
containing a candle, fuel cell composed of waxy flammable material or other open
flame which serves as a heat source to heat air inside the lantern to cause it to lift
into the air. Sky candles, fire balloons and airborne paper lanterns mean the same
as sky lanterns.

G. 2013 CFC SECTION 304.2 — STORAGE: is hereby amended in its entirety to read
as follows:

Page 3



1 “All rubbish or garbage containers that have an open top, combustible
sides or lids, and or metal lids that are not tight fitting or closing must be
located a minimum of 10-feet away from any combustible siding,
overhang, or any other combustible portion of a building or structure.

2 Garbage or rubbish containers may be placed against a combustible
surface or overhang provided it is protected by a domestic supply
automatic sprinkler head, and the area that contains the container is so
configured so the rubbish container will be positioned under the required
automatic sprinkler head. This domestic automatic sprinkler head must
have a shut-off valve that is identified and protected as well as approved
check-valve. The San Miguel Community Services District Fire
Department must approve all garbage or rubbish container automatic fire
sprinkler systems.”

H. 2013 CFC SECTION_307.1.1 — PROHIBITED OPEN BURNING: is hereby

amended in its entirety to read as follows:

7 “All open burning, rubbish, burn barrels, and debris fires are prohibited
within the San Miguel Community Services District's jurisdictional
boundaries, except as permitted and authorized by the San Miguel
Community Services District Fire Department and the San Luis Obispo
County Air Pollution Control District. This amendment does not restrict
barbecues in a permanent approved barbecue pit or a manufactured
device designed for the purpose of being used as a barbecue, as
determined by the San Miguel Community Services District Fire
Department.

2 Warming fires and bonfires require a fire permit issued by the Fire Chief
or and his or her designee.”

2013 CFC Section 308 Open Flames — is amended to add the following section:

308.1.6.3 Sky Lanterns — The ignition and launching of sky lanterns is prohibited.

Exceptions:

Upon the approval of the fire code official, sky lanterns may be used under the
following conditions:

1. When necessary for religious or cultural ceremonies and adequate safeguards
have been taken in the discretion of the fire code official.

2. Sky lanterns shall be tethered in a safe manner to prevent them from leaving
the area and must be constantly attended until extinguished.

2013 CFC SECTION 308.3.1 — OPEN _FLAME COOKING DEVICES: is hereby
amended to add the following:

Page 4



“The Fire Code Official has the final decision regarding approval or disapproval
of all open flame cooking devices.”

K. 2013 CFC SECTION 503.1.1 — BUILDINGS AND FACILITIES : is hereby amended

to add the following provision:

1 Driveway width. Proposed driveways less than 49-feet providing access to a

residential building site shall be a minimum width of 12-feet and shall provide
a minimum fuel modification area of 10-feet on each side of the length of the
driveway. They must also have an unobstructed vertical clearance of 13 feet
6 inches and maintain that clearance during the time the building is present.

2 For longer driveways or access roads the following standards, will apply:

1.

50-200 foot driveways, 14-feet wide, with 13 feet 6 inch maintained
vertical clearance, and a fuel modification area of a minimum of 15-feet
on each side of the length of the driveway, with an approved turnout
provided at or near the midpoint of the driveway.

201 feet or greater length driveways, must be 16 feet in width, with 13
feet 6 inch maintained vertical clearance, and a 15-foot fuel modification
on each side of the length of the driveway, an approved turnout provided
at or near the midpoint. For driveways exceeding 300 feet in length a
turnaround must be provided within 50-feet of the building site. For
driveways 800 feet in length or longer turnouts shall be provided at least
every 400 feet as required by the Fire Department.

If the residential property is located in a CAL Fire designated High or
Very High Wildland Severity Zone and/or a mapped San Miguel
Community Services District Fire Department High and or Very High
Wildland Fire Risk Area, driveway widths shall be a minimum of 16-feet
wide and have a minimum 12-foot fuel modification area on each side of
the driveway for the entire length of the driveway.

L. 2013 CFC SECTION 503.2.3 — SURFACE: is hereby amended in its entirety as

follows:

“All fire apparatus access roads must be able to support a minimum of 40,000

pounds.”

M. 2013 CFC SECTION 503.2.4 — TURNING RADIUS:, is hereby amended in its

entirety to read as follows:

“The turning radius of a fire apparatus access road or driveway shall be at least
28 feet inside radius and 48 feet outside radius.

Exception: When the building is completely protected by an automatic sprinkler
system, including all decks and or overhangs and porches with a combustible
covering, this requirement may be modified, at the sole discretion of the Fire

Chief.”

N. 2013 CFC SECTION 503.2.7 — GRADE: is hereby amended in its entirety to read

as follows:

Page 5




“Fire apparatus access roads or driveways must have a minimum level of
improvement based on the grade of the driveway that provides access from the
public road or right-of-way to the building site. Driveways with less than a 12%
grade must be constructed of a minimum of red rock or other type base to
provide an all-weather road surface. Driveways greater than 12% must be
constructed of a minimum concrete, asphalt, pavers, or other suitable surface to
provide an all-weather non-skid surface. Driveways that exceed 16% grade in
any section must be constructed of an all-weather, non-skid surface and be
designed and approved by a Registered Civil Engineer.”

0. 2013 CFC SECTION 503.4 — OBSTRUCTION OF FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS
ROADS: is hereby amended in its entirety to read as follows:

“The Fire Chief and/or his or her authorized representatives, shall have the
power and authority to remove or cause to remove, without notice, any vehicle
or object parked or placed in violation of the California Fire Code. The owner of
the vehicle or other object removed is responsible for all towing, storage and
other charges incurred.”

P. 2013 CFC SECTION 503.5.1 — SECURED GATES AND BARRICADES: is hereby
amended in its entirety to read as follows:

“Only San Miguel Community Services District Fire Department approved
locking devices may be utilized.”

Q. 2013 CFC SECTION 506.1 — KEY BOXES WHERE REQUIRED: is hereby
amended in its entirety to read as follows:

“Only San Migue! Community Services District approved locks shall be installed
on gates or similar barriers when required by the code official. A manual
disconnect is required if the gate or similar barrier is powered, that will allow
manual opening and unlocking in the event of a failure of the device or power

supply.”

R. 2013 CFC SECTION 506.1.1 — LOCKS: is hereby amended in its entirety to read
as follows:

“Only Knox Company or other key boxes approved by the Fire Chief or and his
or her designee are allowed.”

S. 2013 CFC SECTION 507.5.5 — CLEAR SPACE ARCUND FIRE HYDRANTS: is
hereby amended in its entirety to read as follows:

“A minimum 5-foot clearance is required around all fire hydrants located on
vegetated property or around hydrants located on or adjacent to vacant parcels,
as determined by the Fire Chief or his or her designee.”

T. 2013 CFC 509.1 —IDENTIFICATION.: is hereby amended by adding the following
provision to read as follows:

“All Automatic Fire Sprinkler- Fire Department Connections, (FDC’s), shall be
identified as required by the Fire Chief or their designee, and shall have three
one-inch wide white reflective stripes, placed one-inch apart on the piping or

Page &



other visible location. For residential sprinkler connections, standpipes or other
fire protection devices a permanent sign shall be affixed to the device
identifying at a minimum the address served, the necessary pressure, and the
type of device. The minimum size shall be 12" x12" and must be approved and
located as stipulated by the Fire Chief or his or her designee.”

U. 2013 CFC SECTION 901.7 — SYSTEMS QUT OF SERVICE: is hereby amended y
to read as follows:

“Any time that any fire protection system or device is out of service, the Fire
Chief or and their designee shall be immediately notified. The Fire Chief or his
or her designee may require immediate evacuation and or cessation of usage
and occupancy of the building; until such time that the fire protection system or
device has been returned to service. The Fire Chief or his or her designee
must approve fire-watches and a written log must be completed and maintained
for the entire duration of the fire watch. The log is to remain on the premises
and be available for immediate review by the Fire Chief or his or her designee.
Where utilized, fire watches shall be provided with at least one approved means
for notification of the fire department, and their only duty shall be to perform
constant patrols of the protected premises, keep watch for fires, and to maintain
the required written log.”

V. 2013 CFC SECTION 903.2 — AUTOMATIC FIRE SPRINKLER SYSTEM, WHERE
REQUIRED: is hereby amended in its entirely to read as follows:

“An automatic fire sprinkler system that meets or exceeds the California
Building Code Standards, National Fire Protection Association (NFPA)
Standards and all other recognized standards as approved by the San Miguel
Community Services District Fire Department shall be installed as follows:”

1 All new buildings in all Groups regardless of size shall be protected by an
automatic fire sprinkler system. Covered patio areas or other common areas
that are protected on three sides will be included in sprinkler coverage area.
All new buildings that are mixed use occupancies are required to be entirely
protected by a NFPA 13 compliant automatic fire sprinkler system.

2 All buildings in all Groups proposals to build an addition or to perform an
alteration or remode! where the total square footage will be 25% or more of
total building square feet, must be protected by an approved automatic fire
sprinkler system. In addition all existing or remodeled buildings, which are or
will include a mixed-use occupancy must be entirely protected by a NFPA 13
compliant automatic fire sprinkler system regardless of square footage._ If any
existing building in all Groups except Group-R is deemed to be more
hazardous due to building construction, materials or equipment stored inside
of the occupancy, or the occupancy type, the entire building must be
protected by an approved NFPA Automatic sprinkler system, as determined
and approved by the Fire Chief or his or her designee.

3 All new buildings and other accessory buildings including but not limited to
attached garages, granny units, guesthouses, studios or other residential
units or buildings regardless of square footage must be protected by an

Page 7




automatic sprinkler system. Storage sheds, detached garages and
agricultural building 500 square feet or less are exciuded. All buildings must
be separated by the minimum horizontal distance as required in the California
Build Code or other application codes in order to qualify as a separate
building, in no case shall this separation distance be less than 10 ft. at the
closest point.

4 Al existing buildings, unless excluded, that are altered, Remodeled or
occupancy type changed shell require the installation of automatic fire
sprinkler.

5. These requirements shall be followed, unless the California Fire Code or the
Building Code is more restrictive, whereby the more restrictive standard shall

apply.”

W. 2013 CFC SECTION 903.3.2 — QUICK RESPONSE AND RESIDENTIAL
SPRINKLERS: is hereby amended in its entirety to read as follows:

“All Group-R residences must have an approved automatic fire sprinkler
head(s) installed in all attic or other areas where a forced air unit (FAU) or other
open flame or heat producing device is located. An automatic. sprinkler head
must also be instalied in all Group-R elevators and similar shafis. An inspector’s
test valve must also be installed in all Group-R buildings at the point furthest
opposite from where the fire sprinkler riser enters the building. The location of
these sprinkler heads and inspectors test valves locations are subject to
approval by the San Miguel Community Services District Fire Department.”

X. 2013 CFC SECTION 903.4 — SPRINKLER SYSTEM SUPERVISON AND
ALARMS: is hereby amended in its entirety to read as follows:

“Where required, all automatic sprinkler systems shall be electrically monitored
by a supervised Central Station, listed by Underwriters Laboratory for receiving
fire alarms. Valve monitoring, water flow and trouble signals shall be distinctly
different when transmitted to the central station.

Exceptions:

1 lsolated specialty systems such as paint spray booths, closets and storage
spaces or smaller buildings with less than 20 heads, unless the entire occupancy
is protected by an automatic sprinkler system.

2 All Residential occupancies where the number of heads is less than 50.

3 All other Building Groups that have less than 50 heads, unless they are located
in a remote area, as determined by the Fire Chief, and the lack of monitoring
could cause a significant delay in the report of the system activation.”

Y. 2013 CFC SECTION 904.11.4 — SPECIAL PROQVISIONS FOR AUTOMATIC
SPRINKLER SYSTEMS: is hereby amended in its entirety to read as follows:

Page B



“Automatic fire sprinkler systems protecting commercial type cooking
equipment, including new and existing outdoor permanent barbecues, shall be
supplied from a separate, readily accessible, indicating-type control valve that is
identified. All permanent outdoor barbecues, regardless of size or fuel type
must be protected by an approved automatic fire sprinkler system.”

Z. 2013 CFC SECTION 912.2.2 — EXISTING BUILDINGS: is hereby amended in its
entirety to read as follows:

“On existing buildings, wherever the fire department connection is not visible to
approaching fire apparatus, an approved sign mounted as determined by the
Fire Chief or his or her designee shall indicate the fire department connection
location. Such sign shall meet the requirements for size and materials as
determined by the Fire Chief or his or her designee. All fire department
connections must have three one-inch reflective stripes placed one-inch apart
on or near the fire department connection. Placement of said identification will
be determined by the Fire Chief or duly authorized designee. All existing
buildings that have an existing fire department connection have one (1) year in
which to bring their existing signage and marking up to this standard.”

AA.2013 CFC SECTION 2306.2.3 — ABOVE GROUND TANKS LOCATED OUTSIDE,
ABOVE GRADE: is hereby amended in its entirety to read as follows:

“All above ground liquid motor fuel tanks regardless of class of liquid or size
must be permitted and approved by the Fire Chief or his or her designee.”

BB.2013 CFC SECTION 5504.2.1 — STATIONARY CONTAINERS: is hereby
.émensde% in its entirety to read as follows: [NEED TO DETERMINE WHERE THIS
QES...

“No Flammable Cryogenic fluid stationary storage containers are allowed within
the San Miguel Community Services District boundaries.”

CC. 2013 CFC SECTION 5601 EXPLOSIVES AND FIREWORKS: is hereby
amended in its entirety to read as described in Exhibit “A” attached hereto and
incorporated herein by this reference.

DD. 2013 CFC 5609 SEIZURE OF FIREWORKS: is hereby amended in its entirety
to read as follows:

“The Fire Chief or his or her designee shall have the authority to seize, take
and remove fireworks stored, sold, offered for sale, used or handled in violation
of the provisions of Title 19, California Code of Regulations, Chapter 6 and the
California Health and Safety Code, Chapter 9, except for Safe and Sane
fireworks as approved by the Ordinances and regulations of San Miguel
Community Service District.”

Page 9



BB. 2013 CFC Section 4903 Amended. Section 4903 of the California Fire Code,
entitled “Plans” " is hereby amended to add the following provision:

“Almost the entire San Miguel Community Services Districts service area is located in a
Cal Fire (SRA) designated High Wildland Fire Severity Zone, and San Miguel CSD Fire
Department Wildland Fire/Fuel Risk Map- Medium, High and Very High Fire Risk area.
The 2006 International Urban Wildland Interface Code (as published by the International
Code Council) and the National Fire Protection Association (NFPA) Standard of
Protection of Life and Property from Wildfire 1144 will be utilized to develop fire and life
safety measures to protect life, environment and property located within the San Miguel
Community Services District. When multiple standards apply the most stringent
requirement will be used, as approved by the Fire Chief or his or her designee. Roof
coverings, siding, decking, windows, doors, skylights and ornamental facades must
meet applicable Building and Fire Code Standards and the requirements of the Fire
Chief or his or her designee.”

CC.2013 CFC Section 4710.1.2 Amended. Section 4710.1.2 of the California Fire Code,
entitled “Materials, Systems and Methods of Construction, Roof Coverings” is hereby
amended to add the following sentence to the end of said provision:

“All roof coverings for all occupancy types in all areas within this jurisdiction are required
to be Class-A roofing materials with an approved Class-A assembly.”

DD.2013 CFC Appendix-B Amended. Section B105 of Appendix B of the California Fire
Code, entitled “Flow Requirements for Buildings”, is hereby amended in its entirety to
read as follows:

“The minimum fire flow requirements for one and two family dwellings having a fire-flow
calculation area which does not exceed 3600 square feet shall be 1500 gallons per
minute. All other fire flow and duration for dwellings shall not be less than specified in
Table B105.1.”

EE. 2013 CEC Appendix-D Amended. Section 103.6 of Appendix D of the California Fire
Code, entitled “Signs” is hereby amended in its entirety to read as follows:

“Where required by the Fire Chief or his or her designee, fire apparatus access roads
shall be marked with permanent: NO PARKING-FIRE LANE signs complying with the
dimensions and language as determined by the Fire Chief or his or her designee. Signs
shall have minimum dimensions of 12 inches wide by 18 inches high and have red
letters on a white reflective or other approved background. The Fire Chief or his or her
designee shall require the posting of signs on one or both sides of the fire apparatus
access road as required. Sign Type A, C and D as pictured in the code are examples
and the final determination of the sign size, configuration, and wording shall rest with
the Fire Chief or his or her designee.”

FF. 2012 IWUIC Section 402.2.2 Amended. Exceptions 1 and 2 of Section 402.2.2 of
the International Wildland Urban Interface Code, entitled “Water Supply™, Is hereby
amended to read as follows:

“Individual structures hereafter constructed or relocated into or within wildland-
urban interface areas shall be provided with a conforming water supply in
accordance with Section 404. ‘

Page 10




Exceptions:

1. Structures constructed to meet the requirements for the class of ignition-
resistant construction specified in Table 503.1 for a nonconforming water supply.

2. Buildings containing only private garages, carpons, sheds and agricultural
buildings with a floor area of not more than 500 square feet (56 m?).

GG. 2012 IWUIC Table 502.1 Amended. Table 502.1 of the International Wildland
Urban Interface Code, entitled “Fire Hazard Severity” is hereby repealed.

JJ. 2012 IWUIC Appendix-C Amended. Appendix C of the International Wildland Urban
Interface Code, entitled “Fire Hazard Severity Form” is hereby amended in its entirety to
read as follows:

“In order to determine the applicable Fire Hazard Severity Class rating for the fire code
requirements of any project the CAL-Fire, State Fire Hazard Severity Zone Rating that
is in effect or has been adopted for the San Miguel CSD Fire Department services area
and, or the current San Miguel CSD Fire Wildland Fire Risk map will be utilized to
determine the requirements for the ignition resistant class rating. When there is a
conflict between these two maps the more stringent requirement of the two documents
shall be applied.”

Page 11



SECTION 4 REPEAL OF ORDINANCE No. 08-10.

Ordinance No. 08-10 is hereby repealed in its entirety.

SECTION5 _ PUBLICATION OF ORDINANCE

Within fifteen (15) days after passage of this Ordinance, it shall be published once,
together with the names of the Board Members voting thereon, in a newspaper of
general circulation within the District.

SECTION6 EFFECTIVE DATE

This Ordinance shall take effect and be in full force and effect thirty (30) days after
its passage.

SECTION 7 VALIDITY OF ORDINANCE

If any section, subsection, sentence, clause, or phrase of this Ordinance is for any
reason held to be invalid or unconstitutional by a decision of any court of competent
jurisdiction, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of this
Ordinance. The Board of Directors hereby declares that it would have passed this
Ordinance and each and every section, subsection, sentence, clause, or phrase not
declared invalid or unconstitutional without regard to whether any portion of the
Ordinance would be subsequently declared invalid or unconstitutional.

The foregoing ordinance was introduced at a Special meeting of the Board of
Directors of the San Miguel Community Services District held first on the 21st of
November, 2013

AYES: Kalvans, Harrison, Jarvis, Buckman, Green
NOES:
ABSENT:

ABSTAIN: W /M’

Anthony Kalvans , President
Attest: Board of Directors

i) Pruit,

David Bentz, Secrgtdry and Interim General Manager

Approved as to Form

Timothy J. Carmel, District Counsel

Page 12




EXHIBIT “A”

The discharge, possession and or storage all illegal fireworks is prohibited, except for
professional displays that are permitted and approved by the Fire Chief or his or her
designee, in accordance with Title 19, California Code of Regulations, Chapter 6.

REGULATONS AND RULES PERTAINING TO THE RETAIL SALE AND USE OF
SAFE AND SANE FIREWORKS.

The possession, storage for purposes of sale at retail and use only, sale at retail and
use of “safe and sane” fireworks within the San Miguel Community Services District is
allowed subject to the following rules and regulations:

(a) Definition of “Safe and Sane” Fireworks.

“Safe and Sane” fireworks shail mean those fireworks defined as “safe and sane” in
California Health and Safety Code Section 12529 and classified by the State Fire
Marshall as “safe and sane” in accordance with Section 12562 of the Health and Safety
Code.

(b) Application.

No permits for the sale of “safe and sane” fireworks will be issued to any person, entity,
organization or corporation except those recognized as non-profit associations or
corporations (IRC 501(c)3 status) organized primarily for veteran, patriotic, welfare, civic
betterment, or other similar charitable purposes. Proof of non-profit status shall be
required by producing copies of incorporation documents as registered with the
Secretary of the State of California. All applicants desiring to sell at retail “safe and
sane” fireworks within the District must first make written application for a permit to the
District Fire Chief. Applications for permits shall be made in writing on a form provided
by the District, and submitted to the District during the period of January 1 to March 31
each year. If March 31 falls on a Saturday or Sunday, then the filing period will be
extended to the next business day. Two (2) permits will be issued per year by the
District. A third permit may be issued by special approval of the Board of Directors. Only
non-profit organizations with their principal meeting place located within the District
boundary are eligible for permit issuance. Permitees from the previous year before shall
have priority.

Each permittee shall be limited to a single temporary fireworks stand or structure
(hereinafter “stand”) space, however multiple organizations may share a single stand.

The District reserves the right to maintain a list of additional eligible willing applicants,
should a permittee fail to perform consistent with the permit terms and conditions and
these regulations during any part of the allowed selling period.

Applicants shall be advised of approval or denial of their application within ten (10)
business days of the close of the application period.

(c) License as a Prerequisite.

Page 13



The Fire Chief shall not accept an application for a permit from any person who does
not possess, and present at the time of application, evidence of a valid license to
perform those acts specified on the application for a permit, as such license is defined in
Health and Safety Code Section 12517. .

(d) Investigation and Report.

The Fire Chief shall undertake an investigation and prepare a report of their findings
and determination concerning the issuance of the permit, together with the reasons
thereof.

(e) Grant or Denial of Permit.

The Fire Chief may approve or deny the permit or approve the permit, subject to such
reasonable conditions, if any, as he/she shall prescribe. Such conditions may include,
but are not limited to:

() Prepayment of a clean-up fee , in an amount set by Resolution of the District Board
of Directors, which may be refunded in whole or in par, if the sale location and public
areas where “safe and sane” fireworks are used, are free of used and spent fireworks
and related materials by July 5, as determined by the Fire Chief;

(i} Requiring the permittee to provide each purchaser of “safe and sane” fireworks with
a copy of the restrictions and safety guidelines for the use of “safe and sane” fireworks
in San Miguel, and to sign a receipt of acknowledgement agreeing 10 said provisions.
Permittees may also be required to have each purchaser agree and provide evidence
that he/she is eighteen (18) years of age or older, and that such fireworks will not be
used by anyone less than that eighteen (18) year s of age;

(i) Notwithstanding any other provision of law, the permittee will be required to furnish
to the District Fire Chief with a policy of public liability and property damage insurance,
with no deductible, with limits and terms set by Resolution of the District Board of
Directors. The District and its officers, directors, and employees shall be named as
additional insured under such public liability policy. A certificate of insurance shall be
presented consistent with the above prior to sale and shall provide that the insurer wiil
not cancel or reduce the coverage without thirty (30) days prior written notice to the
District.

(iv) A non-refundable permit fee set by Resolution of the District Board of
Directors may be required to cover the District's costs in administering and enforcing the
provisions of this Ordinance. The permit fee shall be paid to the District upon approval
of the permit.

() Designation of Location for Sale of “Safe and Sane” Fireworks.
Permits issued shall designate the location at which the permittee may sell at retail “safe
and sane” fireworks. Applicants shall obtain, at their sole cost, all other necessary

Page 14




permits or licenses from the County of San Luis Obispo or other public entity, including
but not limited to, building and use permits, for the operation of a retail fireworks stand
or equipment. Stands shall be separated by a linear distance of at least 600 feet.

(g) Revocation.

The Fire Chief may revoke a permit for just cause where a fire nuisance exists, or for
other violation of the terms herein described, or where personal injury may occur. This
determination may be appealed to the District General Manager, and subsequently, t0
the Board of Directors.

(h) Signage

Any approved retail location that sells “safe and sane” fireworks will be required to post
a banner which shall read, “this fireworks stand is sponsored by (name of organization)
located in (City or District organization is headquartered)’. The banner shall be of a fire
resistant material and shall have a twelve inch (12”) white background with six-inch (6”)
solid black-block letters. The banner design and material shall be approved by the Fire
Chief prior to granting permission to sell “safe and sane” fireworks. The banner shall be
clearly posted above the retail area of the stand in a conspicuous location and shall be
posted during the regular hours of retail operation.

(i) Salespersons.

No person under the age of 18 shall sell, or handle for sale, any “safe and sane”
fireworks. No persons convicted of selling fireworks, firearms, liquor and/ or tobacco, to
persons under the age of 18 within the three (3) prior to the date of permit issuance
years shall sell, or handle for sale any “safe and sane” fireworks.

(j) Location of Use of “Safe and Sane” Fireworks.
“Safe and Sane” fireworks may be used only within the District boundaries, and may
only be discharged on July 4 when all of the foliowing conditions are met:

(i) There is at least a 50’ radius (100’ in diameter) clear of all combustible materials;
(i1 There is an adequate water supply provided, consisting of at least a 5/8” garden
hose with an adjustable charged pressure nozzle;

(iii) There is an adult (over the age of 18) in attendance at all times.

(iv) If over 21 years of age, persons igniting the “safe and sane” fireworks are not over
the legal alcohol limit of .08 blood alcohol concentration.

(v) All fireworks shall be removed from sales stands by noon on July 6",

(k) Time
Permitted sales of “safe and sane” fireworks shall be limited to the period set by
Resolution of the Board of Directors of the San Miguei Community Services District, and
shall not unreasonably annoy or otherwise cause a nuisance to the surrounding area.
Permitted discharge or use of “safe and sane” fireworks shali be July 4" in legally
permitted locations.

() Additional Regulations

Page 15




The District Board of Directors may, by Resolution, establish additional regulations
related to the possession, storage, use and sale of “safe and sane” fireworks.

(m) Violations.

In addition to any other violations provided by law, the following shall constitute
violations related to the possession, storage, sale and use of “safe and sane” fireworks
within the District:

(i) To sell or offer for sale, “safe and sane” fireworks at any time outside of the
period established herein.

(i) To use or discharge “safe and sane” fireworks at any time outside of the period
established herein.

(i)  To store any “safe and sane” fireworks without having in their possession a valid
permit as required by this Ordinance.

(iv)  To store or possess any “safe and sane” fireworks for which a license is required
and which has been revoked or surrendered or any license which has not been
renewed, and such storage or possession is held beyond the period provided for in
Section 12604 of the Health and Safety Code.

(v)  To store, sell, or discharge any “safe and sane” fireworks in or within one-
hundred (100) feet of a location where gasoline or any other Class 1 flammable liquids
are stored or dispensed.

(vi) To place, throw, discharge or ignite, or fire any “safe and sane” fireworks at any
person.

(vii) To sell or transfer any “safe and sane” fireworks to a consumer or user thereof other
than at a permitted stand for which all necessary licenses and permits have been
issued.

(vii)  To allow or permit a fire nuisance, as defined in Section 2510 of the Health and
Safety Code, to exist on any premises where any “safe and sane” fireworks are sold or
stored.

(ix) To conduct a public display without possessing a valid permit for this purpose.

(x) To advertise to sell “safe and sane” fireworks without a valid license and permit.

(xi) To sell, give, or deliver any “safe and sane” fireworks to a person who is under 18
years of age.

Page 16




(xii) To perform any act, or transact or attempt to transact any business, with an expired
license or an expired permit where a license or permit is required for the performance of
such act or transaction.

(n) Penalties.

Except as provided in Section 12702 of the Health and Safety Code, any person who
violates any provision of this Ordinance, or any regulations issued pursuant thereto, is
guilty of a misdemeanor, and upon conviction shall be punished by a fine of not less
than five-hundred ($500.00} and no more than one-thousand ($1,000.00), or by
imprisonment in the San Luis Obispo County jail for no more than one year, or by both
such fine and imprisonment.

In addition to all other penalties, the Fire Chief may deny an application to sell “safe and
sane” fireworks if the applicant has previously violated any provision of this Ordinance,
or any regulations issued pursuant thereto.

(o) Violation of Ordinance.

The Fire Chief, or his or her duly authorized representative, is hereby authorized to
issue citations for the misdemeanors specified in Section 13871 of the Health and
Safety Code and for violations of this Ordinance. The provisions of Chapter 5C
(commencing with Section 853.5) of Title 4 of Part 2 of the Penal Code shall apply.

Page 17




RESOLUTION No. 2013-20

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE SAN MIGUEL COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRICT
ADOPTING FINDINGS PURSUANT TO HEALTH AND SAFETY CODE SECTIONS 13869.7, 18941.5 AND
17958.7
FOR THE PURPOSES OF ADOPTING THE 2013 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE
AND THE 2012 INTERNATIONAL WILDLAND URBAN INTERFACE CODE
AND AMENDMENTS THERETO

WHEREAS, pursuant to California Government Code Section 61100(d)}, the San Miguel Community
Services District {District) has the express power to supply the inhabitants of the District with fire
protectiory; and

WHEREAS, Section 13869 of the Health and Safety Code of the State of California, authorizes the
District to adopt an ordinance that incorporates by reference fire prevention codes and amendments,
and Section 13869.7(a) of the Heaith and Safety Code authorizes adoption of building standards
relating to fire and panic safety that are more stringent than those adopted by the State Fire Marshal
and contained in the California Building Standards Code, subject to making findings in accordance with
Sections 1894 1.5 and 17958.7 of the Health and Safety Code; and

WHEREAS, in order for the District to provide improved and more comprehensive fire protection
service to its residents, the District desires to adopt, with amendments, the most current editions of the:
California Fire Code — 2013 edition, the International Wildland Urban Interface Code — 2012 edition,
and the most current National Fire Protection Association Standard 1144.

WHEREAS, pursuant to District Fire Department Findings, more strict standards are necessary due to
local climatic, geographicai and/or topographical conditions that exist within the San Miguel
Community Services District boundary; and

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, the Board of Directors of the San Miguel Community Services
District hereby approves and adopts the findings set forth in the attached Exhibit A “Fire Code
Findings", as prepared by District Fire Chief Rob Roberson.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Board of Directors of the San Miguel Community Services District
has determined that as a result of the climatic, geographical and/or topographical conditions set forth
in the attached Exhibit A “Fire Code Findings,” it is necessary to adopt, by ordinance, more stringent
building standards relating to fire and public safety then as set forth in California Fire Code — 2013
edition, the international Wildiand Urban Interface Code - 2012 edition, and the most current National
Fire Protection Association Standard 1144.

RESOLUTION No. 2013-20 of Board of Directors of the San Miguel Community Services District was
duly adopted at the special meeting of the Board on the 21% day of ,November 2013, on the following
roil cail vote:

AYES: Kaivans, Jarvis, Buckman, Green
NOES:
ABSTAIN:

//
ABSENT: Harrison :
_ -
t

Attest: , ident

Anthony Kalvahs, Présiden
David Bentz, Secreta@)\d Interim General Manager

Board of Directors

Approved as to Form

Timothy J. Carmel, District Counsel



ATTACHMENT A
Reso_l_ution No.__2013-20___

FIRE CODE FINDINGS
OF THE
SAN MIGUEL COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRICT FIRE DEPARTMENT

Pursuant to Sections 13869.7, 18941.5 and 17958.7 of the California Health and Safety Code, the
report contained herein is for the purpose of making findings that modifications or changes to
building standards relating to fire and panic safety are reasonably necessary because of local climatic,
geological or topographical conditions. This Findings document supports the San Miguel Community
Services District Ordinance No. XX-2013.  Under this ordinance, specific amendments have been
established which are more restrictive in nature than those set forth in the California Fire Code - 2013
edition, the International Wildiand Urban interface Code — 201 2 edition, and the most current National
Fire Protection Association Standard 1144, ali of which have been adopted by the State of California.

The California Fire Code — 2013 edition, {commonly referred to as the California Code of Regulations,
Title 24, Part 9) the International Wildland Urban interface Code — 2012 edition, and the most current
National Fire Protection Association Standard 1144, all of which have been adopted by the State of
California wiil be recognized by the San Miguel Community Services District (District) Fire Department
(SMFD.} The amendments made thereto by the District address the fire problems, concerns, and future
directions, by which this District can establish and maintain an environment which will deliver adequate
levels of fire protection and life safety protection to its citizens and visitors.

Under the provisions of Sections 13869.7, 18941.5 and 17959.7 of the California Health and Safety
Code, local amendments shall be based on climatic, geographicai, or topographical conditions. The
Findings contained herein shall address each of these conditions that, either singularly or in
combination, necessitate amendments be adopted.

SAN MIGUEL COMMUNITY PROFILE (SERVICE AREA)

Father Fermin Francisco de Lasuén founded Mission San Miguel on July 25, 1797 at latitude 35.752
and longitude 120.696. San Miguel's elevation is approximately 650 feet above sea level.

The town of San Miguel has existed and grown from that time to present. The majority of San
Miguel is made up of single-family residential housing, a small commercial business district, one
elementary school, and one large commercial winery. Housing areas span both sides of the Salinas
River and railroad track. The San Miguel Community Services District boundary encompasses an ared of
approximately 5 (five) square miles, with a residential popuiation of approximately 2500 {twenty-five
hundred.)

The physical location of District boundaries lay within the northern portion of the San Luis Obispo
County with its northern border approximately one mile south of the Monterey county line. The
District's eastern border runs parallel to the Salinas River and encompasses the San Lawrence Terrace,
then drops to approximately follow the railroad track. lts southern border runs approximately to the
Mission Street Exit from US Highway 101. Its western border runs parallel to US Highway 101 and
approximately 1,000 to 2,500 feet west of the Highway. Passing through the District is US Highway
101 and the River Road Bridge crossing the Salinas River; which is the only river crossing for the entire
CSD boundary.

Based on the profile of the service area, the San Miguel Community Services District Fire Department
established certain requirements to increase the level of fire safety to the residents of San Miguel as well
as the buildings and property within its boundaries. The following factors were established as points of
concern to the San Miguel Fire Department, and are herein established and submitted as the
“Findings.”

Page 2



ATTACHMENT A

1. CLIMATE

The ciimate weather patterns within San Miguel are a California chaparral environment, which is
mainly dry grassland and cak woodland, (sometimes described as a "high desert” climate.) in summer,
the temperature may climb to 119° F, while winters are usually cool and moist. During summer, it is
not unusual to have a 50° F temperature difference between daytime high and overnight low. A
steady northwest wind is present in afternoon to late evening.

Normal rainfail averages 15-20 inches annually. During the winter rainy periods, San Miguel has the
potential to experience flooding along the Salinas River and drainage ways, interrupting emergency
services during these flooding events. It would be imperative that the community has automatic fire
suppression systems to extinguish or control a fire to which the Fire Department has a delayed
response to. During summer and fali months, temperatures can average 100° plus degrees and can
exceed 110° degrees for many consecutive days. Dry wind removes moisture from vegetation, causing
acute fire potential. San Miguel has experienced periods of drought, which push fuel moisture levels to
significant low levels for extended periods of time. During late summer and fall, wind can move fire
quickly across the hills and/or through residential and commercial areas of San Miguel.

2. GEOLOGICAL

San Miguel is within an active seismic area. During the last few years earthquakes located in San
Simeon and Parkfield caused seismic activity within San Miguel. Several active fauits are located to the
East of San Miguel and could result in damage occurring within the Community of San Miguel. The
potential for severe damage does exist with these active seismic areas. The disruption of streets,
roadways, railroad crossings, and especially the Salinas River Bridge crossing due to seismic damage
would delay the arrival of emergency fire response and allow fires to quickly escalate beyond the
department’s ability to suppress them. The instailation of Automatic Fire Suppression systems will allow
for improved response and a faster suppression response by the automatic systems prior to Fire
Department arrival.

Although the fire department and water system in San Miguel are currently rated Class-8 by the
insurance Services Offices, with the above noted hazard, it is possible that major fire flow requirements
couid be disrupted and automatic fire suppression systems requiring much less water would be the only
means of extinguishment. A planned improvement to the community’s water storage system has
resulted in additional water storage; however, our community still remains short of the required
amount to adequately protect the community. The San Miguel Community Services District is currently
working toward a muiti-year plan to improve the community water storage shortfall.

The potential for earthquakes influences fire protection planning. A major seismic event would
create a community-wide demand on fire protection services, which would be beyond the response
capability of the Fire Department, near shore and tong distance. This potential problem can be partially
mitigated by requiring initial fire control through the instailation of automatic fire protection systems.
This will assist in controlling or extinguishing fires in buildings, which will increase the avaiability of
firefighting resources after seismic activity.

|. STATEMENT OF THE PROBLEM

The Fire Department is charged with the task of providing a reasonable degree of fire and life safety
protection to the residents and visitors to our town. The continued deveiopment and growth of San
Miguel, as it relates to the defivery of fire protection, are of major concern if we are to continue to
provide even a minimum level of fire protection to our community.

These findings address the problem of community growth and cost of fire control while offering an
alternative approach to the continuaily growing demand for publicly funded fire protection services.

Page 3



ATTACHMENT A
Resolu_t_ion No. 201 3-2()

A report by the Institute for Local Seif-Government entitled “Alternative to Traditional Public Safety
Delivery Systems.” finds that a fire chief must move toward built-in private fire protection equipment
and systems if they are to control the fire department’s operational budget, and adequately address the
community fire protection probiem.

This study, using guidelines from the Institute for Local SelfGovernment and the National Fire
Protection Association, proposed that the fire department control fires in all new structures built within
their jurisdiction. This couid be accomplished by using an established emergency response assignment
that will not create a deficiency in the fire protection services currently offered to the already
established community.

The San Miguel Fire Department emergency response assignment varies, depending on Volunteer
Firefighter (PCF) availability. Most Fire Departments consider two engine companies, a rescue unit, an
EMS unit (paramedics) and a Chief Officer to be a minimum emergency response assignment for a
single-family structure fire.

The San Miguel Fire Department daily staffing includes one volunteer firefighter (who is also
employed by the CSD for other duties during weekdays) and volunteers to staff a single Engine
Company, and Automatic Aid response from CAL Fire/San Luis Obispo County Fire, other adjacent
agencies and any available paid cali firefighters. It seems reasonable that new structures constructed or
additions to existing structures, in San Miguel, be protected by buiit-in fire protection systems. The
criteria for controlling the cost of fire protection in the District is to cause {by ordinance} new structures,
regardiess of type of construction or occupancy, to be equipped with automatic fire sprinkiers.

The amendments based upon the findings contained herein relate to the adoption of the California
Fire Code — 2013 edition, {commonly referred to as the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9)
the International Wildland Urban interface Code - 2012 edition, and the most current National Fire
Protection Association Standard 1144, all of which have been adopted by the State of California. The
amendments made thereto by the District address the fire problems, concerns, and future direction by
which this District can establish and maintain an environment which will defiver adequate levels of fire
protection and life safety protection to its citizens and visitors provides a reasonable and established
means of adequately protecting life, the environment and property in San Miguel.

These findings and future fire code ordinances, amendments and adoptions of the same category
reduce the need for large additions to publicly funded fire protection, and allow the District to grow
with reasonable expansion of the Fire Department. They aiso place fire protection and prevention in
the community where the benefit can be realized more quickly and with greatest benefit.

While smoke detectors are intended to provide an early warning that allows occupants to escape or
defend themselves from fire hazard, automatic sprinklers are meant to control or extinguish a
developing fire and to enable occupants to better escape. Automatic sprinklers are designed to
respond immediately to suppress fire early in the fire's development stages. This will allow for the
suppression or extinguishment of fire, and stili leave a breathable atmosphere for occupants to safely
exit the building. Automatic fire sprinklers can also contain the fire to the building of origin, and
therefore potentially keep the fire from spreading to the exterior wildiand environment.

Based on these “Findings,” Qrdinance No. 01-2013 will provide effective protection of the residents,
property, the environment and help reduce the devastation of fire.

It should also be noted these findings are only a part of the total San Miguel CSD Master Plan. This
may be one of the single most important elements toward the progressive improvement of the delivery
of fire and life safety protection services.

Page 4




ATTACHMENT A

While the adoption of Ordinances and Codes may not prevent all incidents of fire or deaths there
from, the implementation of the various codes and requirements wiil reduce the severity and potential
for the loss of life, damage to the environment and property damage in our community.

The San Miguel CSD Fire Department submits these “Findings” and requests adoption of same
pursuant to the provisions of Sections 13869.7, 18941.5 and 17958.7 of the State of California Health
and Safety Code.

Prepared and submitted by:

4 L

RobfRoberson, Fife Chief
Sar Miguel Community Services District
Fire Department

Page 5




San Miguel Community Services District
Organization & Personnel Committee

June9, 2016 AGENDA ITEM: V.2

SUBJECT: Review and Discuss Existing Section 2020 of District Personnel Policy regarding
recruitment and hiring policies

STAFF RECOMMENDATION:

Review and Discuss Existing Section 2020 of PersbRolicy regarding recruitment and hiring
policies and give direction to Staff.

BACKGROUND:

This request was initiated by O & P Committee sitMiarch meeting. The Committee requested
a review and discussion of existing Personnel polielated to recruitment and hiring
procedures.

The existing policy in effect is Section 2020 o tkxisting Personnel Policy. Regarding Section
2020, the following language is in effect:

"Applicants for employment shall be evaluated oe thasis of their submitted materials,
personnel interviews and demonstrated ability. Dirict will only solicit applications when
position openings exist, or when vacancies or nesitjpn openings are anticipated, or when
employees have tendered letters of resignationetrement. Upon completion of such
evaluation, the Board will be notified of final digants, and the General Manager, or designee,
shall select the applicant to be employed to ffi# position opening, and shall promptly notify
the Board of the name of the person selected. ToerdBshall review and approve such a
selection based on background check, drug testidgca#izenship verification.” Any change in
job classification or compensation requires Boantiba.

The proposed Personnel Policy Manual, which wasmagended to Board for action states the
following revision to recruitment and hiring proceds that are in alignment with State and
Federal laws on employment:

Chapter 2.0 Employment Practices, Section 2.2 Rewent procedures spells out distinctions in
open, promotional and continuous employment exatioimg of applicants. Section 2.3 Hiring

procedures require an examination of qualificatiohgpplicant for position, a medical exam,

drug testing and citizenship verification.



Any change in employment status, such as a jolagsification and/or a change in compensation
must be first approved by the Board of Directossch as recently done. If the Board of

Director's approves a fiscal year operating budgeployment positions, such as the existing 4
positions plus 2 contract positions, then thesatipos are considered authorized. If there are
new positions proposed, then Board must, firshanze and approve any new positions and rate
of compensation prior to recruitment and hiringnc® a qualified applicant has been selected
and has completed medical exam, drug testing arzewiverification, then the General Manager

provides a hiring decision.

Staff Recommendation:
Staff recommends that the Committee discuss areldjrection to Staff.

PREPARED BY:

Darrell Gentry
General Manager

Attachment:  Section 2020 of existing Personneldyoli



RECRUITMENT NUMBER: 2020
CHAPTER TWO - EMPLOYMENT EFFECTIVE: NOVEMBER 2014

REVISED

2020 - RECRUITMENT

1.

Employment — Hiring

Applicants for employment shall be evaluated on Ilasis of their submitted
material(s), personal interview(s), and demonddrateility. This District shall
retain all employment applications for a periocoat year, whereupon they shall
be discarded. The District will only solicit apgtions when position openings
exist, or when vacancies or new position openings anticipated, or when
employees have tendered letters of resignatioetoement. Upon completion of
such evaluation, the Board will be notified of firspplicants, and the General
Manager, or designee, shall select the applicabetemployed to fill the position
opening, and shall promptly notify the Board of ézitors of the name of the
person selected. The Board of Directors shallese\and approve such selection.
If two people are hired on the same day for jolag trave the same rate of pay, it
must be determined who was hired first. If twogleare hired on the same day
for different rates of pay, the employee with thghler pay rate will be deemed
the employee hired first.

It is the philosophy of the District to promdtem within the District, unless it is
or would be in the District’s best interest to hirem the outside. It will be up
to the General Manager to consider all qualifie@nmal candidates for the open
position.

Employment of Relatives

The General Manager may disqualify from competitiany applicant for

employment or transfer request where the result pbsitive hiring or transfer
decision would put an employee in direct supervisad (or under the direct
supervision of) a close family relative: spouses;habitants, parents, children,
and siblings.

Pre-Employment Physical Examination

All offers of employment shall be made contingentom the respective
applicant’s successfully passing a physician’s e@ration and drug test, to be
provided at District expense.

An applicant shall not be employed until a negatiugg screen result is obtained
and a qualified physician has certified the appliga qualified to do the type of
work required by the position being applied for.

SAN MIGUEL COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRICT EMPLOYMENT 2 000
PERSONNEL POLICIES




